RESOLUTION NO. 2818

A RESOLUTION OF THE MAYOR AND PAYSON TOWN COUNCIL
AMENDING CHAPTER 150: BUILDING REGULATIONS AND
CONFORMING CHANGES TO SECTION 154-07-002(D) (3) OF THE
PAYSON TOWN CODE AND DECLARING SUCH AMENDMENTS TO
BE A PUBLIC RECORD.

2014 CONSTRUCTION CODE AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the Code of the Town of Payson was declared to be a public record by
Resolution Number 1536 of the Town of Payson; and

WHEREAS, the Code of the Town of Payson was adopted as a public record by
Ordinance Number 588 of the Town of Payson; and

WHEREAS, it is the intention of the Town of Payson to amend Town Code Chapter
150: Building Regulations, amend the Town'’s Standardized Construction Codes, and make a
conforming change to Town Code Chapter 154; and

WHEREAS, such amendment may be enacted by reference, pursuant to A.R.S. § 9-802,

NOW, THEREFORE, THE MAYOR AND PAYSON TOWN COUNCIL
RESOLVE AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Chapter 150: Building Regulations of the Payson Town Code is amended, as

amended shall read as set forth in Exhibit A attached, and such amendment is declared to be a

public record.

Section 2. Section 154-07-002(D) (3) of the Payson Town Code is amended and as amended

shall read as follows:

(D) Block design.

The maximum number of | hatm r ingl in 1
accordance with the International Fire Code adopted by the Town, including, but not

limi Appendix D, Section D1 f such LA mergen m

considered as an additional point of access if approved pursuant to the International Fire

n he Communi | nt Department an Public Work
Department.

Page 1 of 25

Nov 20 20 D, /2. #



PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE MAYOR AND COMMON COUNCIL OF
THE TOWN OF PAYSON this day of , 2014, by the following

vote:

AYES NOES ABSTENTIONS ABSENT

Kenny J. Evans, Mayor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Silvia Smith, Town Clerk Timothy, M. Wright, Town Attorney

Page 2 of 25



EXHIBIT A TO RESOLUTION 2818

CHAPTER 150: BUILDING REGULATIONS

General Provisions

150.01
150.02
150.03
150.04
150.05

Administrative authority Building Offteial
Clearing required after fire

Facilities required on site for construction
Building valuation data

Building Department Fee Schedule

Standardized Building and Construction Codes

150.20
150.21
150.22
150.23
150.24
150.25
150.26
150.27
150.28

150.29

International Residential Code
International Building Code

National Electrical Code

International Mechanical Code
International Fuel Gas Code
International Plumbing Code
International Existing Buildings Code
Installation of Solid Fuel Burning Stoves

Energy Standards Unifermstandard-specifications-and-uniform-details-for

——publie-workseonstruetion

Manufactured home construction and safety standards

International Fire Code

150.45

150.99

International Fire Code

Penalty

Page 3 of 25



GENERAL PROVISIONS
§ 150.01 ADMINISTRATIVE AUTHORITY BUH-BING-OFFIGIAL.

(A)  The Building Departmentand administrative authority as may be;as-sueh-maybe
referenced in any-seetionof this Chapter or any code adopted under this Chapter except the

International Fire dic—feﬁa-ﬂ—ma&ers-peﬁaﬁmm—t&aﬂvmﬁpe&teﬂs; shall be vesfed—m—the—e?ﬁee
ef the des1gnated Bu11d1ng Ofﬁc1al 763

I"

(B) The administrative authority as may be referenced in the International Fire Code

shall be exercised by the Fire Chief.
§ 150.02 CLEARING REQUIRED AFTER FIRE.

(A)  The debris from any burned or partially burned building shall be cleared or
arrangements made to rebuild the structure within 120 days following a fire, with clearing to
commence not later than 60 days following the fire.

(B)  All walls and stacks shall be knocked down and all sewers capped.

(C)  All holes, pits and basements shall be filled.

§ 150.03 FACILITIES REQUIRED ON SITE FOR CONSTRUCTION.

(A)  For the maintenance of public health, all work sites and construction sites within
the town shall provide toilet facilities for all workers and patrons.

(B)  All toilet facilities, whether portable or permanent, shall be screened and
ventilated, with not less than one seat for every 30 workers or persons. At a minimum, there shall
be one portable or permanent toilet facility for each work site.

(C)  All toilets shall be kept clean, properly stocked with necessary provisions and kept
sanitary.

(D)  Temporary facilities shall be provided by the owner, operator or construction
contractor on each site, except that, with the consent of an adjoining owner, facilities may be
provided on the property of the adjoining owner.

(E)  Facilities must be located on the sites of the work area or construction project and

Page 4 of 25



shall not be located within 26 feet of an occupied dwelling or business of an adjoining parcel, lot
or tract.

§ 150.04 BUILDING VALUATION DATA.

The town shall calculate the building valuation data as required by any code adopted
pursuant to this Chapter by utilizing the most current building valuation data as determined from
time to time, and published by Building Standards, a professional trade journal. This provision is
deemed to be self-amending so as to adopt the most current building valuation data, as published
in Building Standards from time to time. The published regional modifiers, as well as the cost per
square foot figures, are adopted herein by this reference as though fully set forth herein.

§ 150.05 BUILDING DEPARTMENT PERMIT FEE SCHEDULE

The building permit fee schedule shall be set by the Council.

STANDARDIZED BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION CODES
§ 150.20 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

(A)  The International Residential Code, 2006 2012 Edition, published May 2011
Jartary-2006 by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted. with-the

following LoealAmendments:
(B)____The following Local Amendments to the International Residential Code are
adopted:

1. ion 105.1 Required. The following lan i he end of thi
ion “In addition, Park Is requir ilding permit for placement. A
inimum I hol n anchors m install uilding corners an
lectrical and mechani ipment that are hard-wired and/or exterior to the uni
ir r rmit.”

2. Section 105.2 (3) - The section is revised so that height is measured from the
f the footing or retainin lls in f th .

3. Section 108.6 Work commencing before permit issuance. The following

language i he end of section “An investigation fee, in addition to th
permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then, or subsequently issued.
he i igation fee shall | in amoun he permit th uld hav n

Page 5 of 25



requir horiz h wor ne, ex hat the minimum amoun

| not | han $50.”
4. Section 112.2.1 Determination of substantial improvement in flood hazard

rea. This su ion is n

5. Section 112,2,2 Criteria for issuance of a variance flood hazard areas. This

U ion is n

. ion 202 Definitions. The following definition i “Park Model
iving Unit. Any f; m rtable uni hich is affixed an Arizon
recreati hicl 1 un n a chassi heels not more than 12 feetin
idth and no gr han 400 re feet in area, nor less than 320 square feet in
lar nd permanently conn utilities that are n ry for th ration
f the install rk model living unit, with no holding tan her than an approv

»

r

) le R301.2 (1) Climatic and Geographical ign Criteria. Shall
amended as follows:

Groun | ind Design Seismic | _ Subjectto damage from Winter lce Flood Alr Mean
—4 | Spee [ Topograph | Design | Weatheri | Erost | Termite | Design | Bami | Hazards.g | Freezin |\ Annual
Snow | Ld) | iceffects-k | Categor ng dept € | femperatur | &r Local | glindex | Temperaty
Load ¥ 2 b-b e-e Reg. | Regs. te
48 | 90 | Exposure B | Negigible | 18° | Slightto 18 No | Engineeri | 1000 83
MPH B Moderat ng Dept.
53

8. _ Footnote (i) is added to Table 301.5 and shall read as follows: “When attic
storage trusses exceed the allowable (3) three trusses for HVAC units and exceed the
limits [i. Isewhere in thi 1 in the footn und live | ign
shall be used.”

9, 302.1 & Table 302.1(1) — The dimension requiring fire protected wall

nstruction for buildings is reduced fr ’ '

10. 2.6 The prin imension of ¥4” is repl ith “5/8” x”.

11.  309.5 Fire sprinklers. The following language is added at the beginning of the
ion: “In homes having a fire {1 less than 150 lons/min nd havin
livabl reater than 4800sq. ft. private”.

12.  Section 310.1.1 - The Exception is not adopted.

Page 6 of 25




13. ion 311.3.1 2, al ion 311 1. The maximum height i

14. New Section Sectlon 311.5.2.1 is added. “U dg Stair Erg;ggngn, Enclosed

ibl un hllh 11 urf ffi
r n th nl ith 5/8” Type X 1l
15. ion 313.2 One- an famil llin mati ﬁr m h
nditions li xi'
When such buildings h h 00 sq. ft. of livable area and |
h nl llons per minute of fir ﬂ r ilabl he proper r n
h buildings have more than 4800 square f; f livin nd where the |

was created after June 1, 2013. (See Ordinance 833); or
2. When operational procedures include provisions that more than one
rson n le of self preservation that is unrel he person in control of
r upies a resi ial unit for more than 1

16. Section 313.2.1Design and Installation. Strike reference to required fire

rinklers in all single family hom riking th “and installed” from thi
section.
1nZIS The following language i fore the existin
. 5 elated pe esidential unit, the bui

0 m en ill11nn | n rm
hrn | lv with the provisions of ch r 11 of the International
Building Code. Additionally”

18. Section 322 Flood-Resistant Construction, The Building Official may use
flood resistant construction requirements in this section under his authority to

rmine structur ruction requirements, h r the Town Engineer shall
local ordinances to mandate when a flood potential exists and all benchmarks and

ingm mpl in compliance with Engineering Departmen
standards.

19. Section 506.1 General. The following sentence is added to the section
“Control Joints in unreinforced concrete slab floors on grade shall be provided at a
maximum of 12 feet on center, in both directions.”

20. Section 606.9.1 Horizontal lateral support. The section is revised to read as
follows: “Minimum reinforcement requirements for masonry elements. Masonry

Page 7 of 25



lements shal reinfor 1 ne #4 rebar, in both the horizontal an

rtical directions at no further than 4’ on center. itionall ingle #4 rebar i
requir ithin 6 i f th f n 11 horizontally and al
ithin 18” verti f the end of th 1l an nings.
21.  Section 12 A X i : “On exterior walls that are suppor
Min. of 6” above grade by the same foundation that supports the exterior wall, the
ater resistive barrie ashing and venee ay extend down to grade s grade
provided that the ends of the water resistive barrier and flashing are moisture sealed.”
22 ion G2 neth identification: This su ion is n
23. Section M1 1 Applian for in ion service, repair an
replacemen nly the first sentence of this su ion i

25. P2 1.1 Th rds “ ified in amen ion 313.2 and in
Townhouses” are inser fter th rds ‘dwelling unit.’
X ion E3902.2 The following ex ions ar his su ion:
Exceptions:
1.R les on the ceilin ifically installed for gar I openers.

27. _Appendix Chapters to be adopted specifically:
ndix G- Swimming Pool, S n T

(i) Add wording to AG101.1 General, Installers must comply with
he energy efficiency requirements of IR ion, N1103.9 including th
installation of Heaters, Time switches and Covers. The exception at the
nd of ion 1103.9.3 mavy n ilized.

(b) Appendix M-Home Day Care-R-3 Occupancies

(c) Appendix N-Venting Methods

Appendix Q-IR idential Electrical Provision ional
Electrical C ross Reference.

Page 8 of 25



Page 9 of 25



INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

(A)  The International Building Code, 2012 2006 Edition, published May 2011 }ure
2006 by the International Code Council, Inc., is kereby adopted. along-with-the-fellowing

loealamendnrents:
The following Local Amendmen he Internation ildin I
adopted:
1. ion 101 ferenced C - The last line after th rds “ i
is revi read: “such hat h ificall he Town of
Payson”.

2. Section 104.10.1 Fl hazard ar This su ion is n

3. Insert new section 105.8 Construction Debris, “Construction sites shall
be kept reasonably clear of construction debris during the course of construction.
Construction debris shall be removed or stored on the site and not be at risk of

i i h nditions.”

4, Section 107.2.5.1 Design Flood Elevations. This subsection is not

adopted.

3. Section 109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance - Add the
following language to the end of this section, “An investigation fee, in addition to
the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then, or subsequently
issued. The investigation fee shall be equal in amount to the permit that would
have initially been required to authorize such work to be done, except that the
minimum amount to be collected may be not less than $50.”

6. Section 110,3.10.1 Flood hazard determination — Subsection is
amended to read “If located in a flood hazard area, documentation of the
elevation of the lowest floor as required by adopted city floodplain ordinances

Page 10 of 25



hall mi he Town engineerin rtment for revi n roval

rior to the issuance of rtifi f upan

) 12 ight and Area limi identi ircy rs) Thi

8. 903.2.8 The following language is added to the end of the subsection

“Except R3 single family detached and duplex structures with less than 4800 sq. ft.

of livable space within the building and where no more than one unrelated person,

hatisn le of self preservation resides in the structure for more than 1
n i "

9. Section 2 lazin jacen irs and ramps. After th r

landings an n flights of stairs. th rds “in the direction of travel within
0 inches horizontally” are inserted. Additionally, the following sen i

he end of th. ion “In ition, all glazing within 3’ vertically an
rizontally, of a landing, or stairs not in the direction of travel is consider
hazar 1 ion.”

10. Section 2 - Thi ion is n

11. Table 2902.1 Footn f) - Th u | her r
fountain is required is increased from 15 to 30 people, except that F, H. M and S

Qccupancies that have employees, where 15 shall remain the governing occupant
load in rdan. ith the IBC without revision.

12. ion 3109 Pool Enclosures and Safety Devices — Thi ion i

N . Ref; | r applicable requirements.

13. Appendix Ch rs are n

Page 11 of 25



§ 150.22 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

(A)  The National Electrical Code, 2605 2011 Edition, published copyright 2010
Angrst-57-2004 by the National Fire Protections Association, Inc., is hereby adopted. with
the-followingloealamendments:

(B) No Local Amendments to the National Electric Code are adopted.

§ 150.23 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

(A)  The International Mechanical Code, 2606 2012 Edition, published April 2011
May2006 by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted. with-the-follewing

lecal-amendments:

(B) The following Local Amendments to the International Mechanical Code are
adopted:

1. 401, 2 Ventilation required. This section is amended to read: “Every

occupied space shall be ventilated by natural means in accordance with Section

402 or by mechanical means in accordance with Section 403. Where the air

filtration rate in a dwelling unit is less than 5 air changes per hour when tested

with a blower door at a pressure of 0.2 inch water column (50 Pa) in accordance
ith ion 4.1.2, Building Thermal Envel i ion, of

Page 12 of 25



International Fnergy Conservation Code, the dwelling unit shall be ventilated by
mechanical means in rdan ith ion 403.”

2. 306.5.1 Sloped roofs. The same exception for R-3 occupancies that is
in ion 306.5 shal hi i

fropa Yo B oen
O

" o
TTUTITL dlT

o uarding
L) B WUIUILIS

,.._.
g
q
[¢]
a.

e
~
s

2

Q Qaptiam 3I0A iedalosad
A% CLCTIUTT UV IO CITCIC LU,
0 S ameinmn 402 2 4 e dalesad
7 VCCTIOTT T 77T I ULTO LU,

§ 150.24 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE

(A)  The International Fuel Gas Code, 2606 2012 Edition, published April 2011 Mareh
2006 by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted. with-the-followingloeal

amendments:

(B)  The following Local Amendments to the International Mechanical Code are
adopted:

1. liances in attics. The first sentence is amen r
follows: “Adttics containing appliances shall be provided with an opening and

of the appliance.” The words “component of” are added to the end of the
paragraph after the word largest and before the word appliance.

2. 306.4 Appliances under floor. Same modification as 306.3.

Page 13 of 25



) Plastic pipin ing and fitting. The fir ragraph is amen
read: “Plastic pi ubing and fittings u ly fuel hall be u

u rs, underground only, and shall conform TM D2513. Pipe shall
m rk %3 ”" n ((A DZ l ".),
manifold, Thi ion is n

§ 150.25 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE

{(A)  The International Plumbing Code, 2666 2012 Edition, published April 2011
Mareh2006 by the International Code Council, Inc., is kereby adopted. with-the

fellewingloealamendments:

(B) The following Local Amendments to the International Mechanical Code are
adopted:

L 12.3 - The first sentence (“plastic pipe shall n using air”) i
not adopted.
2. Reguirements for discharge piping. The followin ions ar
amended:
. Discharge throu ir- n appr rainage fixture, | in
the same room as the water heater
. Di r 1. approv r r, through an air- rtoth
outdoors.
10. N rminate more than 6” xterior grade.

Page 14 of 25



§ 150.26 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDINGS CODE

(A) The International Existing Buildings Code, 2006 2012 Edition, published
Abpril 2011 January-2006 by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted.

(B) No Local Amendments to the International Existing Buildings Code are adopted.

§ 150.27 INSTALLATION OF SOLID FUEL BURNING STOVES.

(A)  No person shall install or operate any woodstove unless such woodstove is:

(1)  Safety listed by a recognized safety testing laboratory; and

(2) Certified when new, to be at least as clean as the EPA Phase 11
Standards for woodheaters as prescribed by the U.S.E.P.A. (MSPS,
40 C.F.R. Part 60, Subpart AAA), or is a fireplace, pellet stove or
masonry heater; and

3) Is an EPA Phase II woodstove or pellet stove installation; and a
permit and final inspection for such installation have been
obtained from the Building Department of the Town for such
installation in accordance with the applicable provisions of the
International Mechanical Code or the International Residential
Code adopted pursuant to this Chapter.

Page 15 of 25



(BY  Definitions

(1)

3)

(4)

Fireplace means a chimney connected, solid fuel or gas burning
appliance, that is intended primarily for occasional recreational and
aesthetic use and only secondarily for incidental heating and that
ordinarily is permanently installed into the structure of a building.
Masonry Heater means a vented, wood burning radiant heating
system constructed primarily of masonry materials weighing at least
1,754 pounds, either site built or assembled from factory made
components, that is designed to burn rapidly, capturing and storing
the resultant heat energy in the mass of the appliance through
internal heat exchange flue channels.

Pellet Stove means a safety listed appliance designed to burn only
wood pellets or any naturally pelleted fuel that is incapable of
burning cord wood and may or may not be certified 40 C.F.R,,
Section 60.

Woodstove means an airtight wood-heater, either freestanding or
inserted into a fireplace.

New Section 150.28 addresses Energy Standards; staff has prepared
three options for the Council to consider:

Option A (adopting minimum insulation standards only; not adopting
International Energy Code)

150.2 Ener n

I

The following minimum energy values shall apply for all Residential and Commercial

Buildings:
Roof R-36
Wall R-19

Page 16 of 25



Basement Walls R-13

Floor R-19
Win -F r.3
Skylight U-Factor .55

Option B (adopting minimum insulation standards, but if construction
complies with optional Energy Code, such compliance noted on
Certificate of Occupancy.)

§ 150,28 Energy Standards.

The following minimum ener ] hall apply for all Residential an
Commercial Buildings:

Roof R-36

Wall __R-19

Basement Walls R-13

Floor  R-19

Window U-Factor .35

light U-Factor .
(B)  The International Ener 2012 Edition, publish ly 2011 by th
nternational uncil, Inc., i n optional/non requir ndard with
the amendments set forth in subsection (C) below. If an applicant requests to follow the
he time of plan submission he construction complies with th h

nshalln h compliance on th ifi {

The following Local Amendmen he Internati ner r
L Section R401 — General and IR ion N1101.16 — Section is revi
to read as follows:
Certifi n A permanent certifi hall mpl n
in the electrical distributi h. u1lrrr1
design Qrgfggggngl Thg certificate §hgll not gggg; or obstruct the ¥1§1L_11hgy_ of
he circuit dir 1, servi nn 1 or other required labels.

he certifi hlll he foll :

e Predominant R-valu fin ulation installed in or on ceiling/roof,
11s, foundation (slab, basement wall, crawl 1l and/or floor
n i1 ndition i

Page 17 of 25



° - rs for fenestration and the solar h. in coefficient (SH

of fenestration.
e The results from du m pressur ing requirements i
e Visuali i nfirmation of requirements in R402.4.1.1 an

Table R402.4.1.1 or 1ts of Building Thermal Envelope Air Leak

Testing option in accordance with R402.4.1.2.
Where there is more than one value for each component, the certificate shall

list the value for the lar rea. The certifi hall list th n

fficiencies of heatin ling and service water heatin ipment. Wher
-fired un room heater, electric furn r rd electric heater

is installed in the resi he certifi hall list “gas-fired unvented room

h " “electric furnace” or * rd electric heater” ropri

Efficien ln listed for gas-fired unvented r heaters, electri

furn r electri rd heaters.

)| Tabl 2.1.1 and IRC Section N1102.1.1 — Tables are amen

follows:
TABLEN1102.1.1
B
CEILI
CLIMA EENESTRATI | NG R-
IE ON U. b) U. ON SHGC (b) | YALU : | WALLR. R- WALL & WALLR-
ZONE FACTORS (b) FACTOR {e) E VALUE VALUE @ VALUE R-VALUE DEPTH YALUE
200r13+45
4 0.35 Q.55 0.4 28 (h) 8/13 19 10/13 10, 18 10/13

3, C | 2.1.3 and IRC Section N1102.1.3 — Tables are amen:

Page 18 of 25



EQUIVELENT U-FACTORS @
FRAME | MASS
CEILIN | WALL WALL | FLOOR | BASEMEN CRAWL
EZONE | NU.FACTOR | FACTOR R R R (b) R FACTOR FACTOR
4 Q.35 0.55 0.03 0.057 0.098 10 0.059 1/0

4. IECC R402 nd IR 1102 laz nestration Exemption. Replace

the printed area of “up to 15 square feet” with “up to 25 square feet” of glazed

fi ration per lling unit shall rmi xempt fi -factor and SH
uirements in N1102.1.1. Exempti n 1 -factor alternative or Total

alternative approach.

5. IECC R402.4.1.1 and IRC N1102.4.1.1 Installation -_the components of the
ilding thermal envel li in Table R402.4.1.1 shall be installed in rdance with
h nufacturer's instructi nd the criteria li in Tabl 2.4.1.1 licabl.
hod of construction. Th official shall recognize the provisions li in
4. i ildi i i ing in R402 4.

6. IECC R402.4.1.2 and IRC N1102-4.1.2 Building Thermal Envelope Air
kage Testin ion - The building or ling unit shall nd verifi

having an air leakage rate of 5 air changes per hour.

Option C (adopting mandatory Energy Standards)

150.2 Energv Stan

(A)  The International Energy gggl 2012 Eglggn, published July 2011 by the
International ncil, Inc.

(B) The following Local Amendments to the International Energy Code are adopted:

1. Section R401 — General and IRC ion N1101.16 — ionisr
to read as follows:

Page 19 of 25




rtifi n A permanent certifi 11 mpl n
n or in the electrical distribution panel he builder or register

design grgfggglgngl The certificate §h§11 not gggg or obstruct the visibility of
he circui ry label, servi nn r other required labels.
The certifi 11 list the foll
e Pr inant R-val fin lation installed in iling/roof,
1Is, foundati lab, basement wall, cr 1l and/or floor
nd du i ndition ir .
° factors for fenestration and the solar h in coefficient (SH.
of fenestration.
o The results from du M _pressur ing requiremen
rdan ith R403.2.2
e Visualin ion confirmation of requirements in R402.4.1.1
Table R402.4.1.1 or lts of Building Thermal En ir Leak
in ion i rdan. ith R402.4.1.2.
Wh here i re than lue for each nent, the certifi hall
list the value for the lar rea. The certifi hall list th n
fficiencies of in ling and servi r heating equipment. Wher

oas-fired unvented room heater, electric furnace, or baseboard electric heater
is installed in the residence, the certificate shall list “gas-fired unvented room

heater”, “electric furnace” or rd electric h r’ ropri
Effici hal listed fi fir nven m 1s, electri
furn r electri r 1S.
2. CC Table R402.1.1 and IRC ion N1102.1.1 — Tables are amen
follows
INSULATION AN
CLIMA FENESTRATI SKYLIGHT
ZONE | FACTORS (b) | FACTOR (e) E VALUE | VALUE () | VALUE | R-VALUE | DEPTH VALUE
20o0r13+5
4 0.35 0.55 0.4 38 (h) 8/13 19 10/13 10, 18" 10/13

d. R-5 SHALL BE ADDED TO THE REQUIRED SLAB EDGE R-VALUES FOR HEATED SLABS. INSULATION DEPTH SHALL BE 18"

Page 20 of 25




TABLE N1102.1.3

EQUIVELENT U.FACTORS (s
FRAME | MASS
CEILIN | WALL WALL | ELOOR | BASEMEN CRAWL
E ZONE N U-FACTOR | FACTOR R R R (b) R FACTOR FACTOR
0.35 Q.55 0.03 0.057 0.098 1/0 0.059 1/0

) IE 2 nd IRC N110Q2 Glazed Fenestration Exemption, R
he prin rea of “ 15 square feet” with “u 25 square feet” of glaz
fenestration per lling unit shall rmi mpt fr - r and SH

requirements in N1102.1.1. Exemption does not apply to U-factor alternative or Total
alternative approach.

. IECC R402.4.1.1 and IRC N1102.4.1.1 Installation - _the components of the
building thermal envel i in Tabl 2.4.1.1 shall be installed in n ith
he manufacturer’s instructions and the criteria li in Tabl 02.4.1. licabl
to the method of construction. The code official shall recognize the provisions listed in
le R402.4.1.1 isual alternati uilding or lling uni ing in R402.4.1.2.

6. IECC R402.4.1.2 and IRC N1102-4.1.2 Building T'hermal Envelope Air
building or dwelling unit shall be tested and verified 2

§ 150.29 MANUFACTURED HOME CONSTRUCTION AND SAFETY STANDARDS.

(A) Manufactured home construction and safety standards adopted by the U.S.
Department of Housing and Urban Development (HUD), pursuant to the National

Page 21 of 25




Manufactured Housing Construction and Safety Standards Act of 1974, 42 USC 5401 et
seq., and amendments thereto, are hereby adopted as manufactured home construction and
safety standards for the Town. Three copies of 42 USC 5401 are hereby maintained in the
Town Clerk’s office and are hereby adopted by this reference.

(B) The Building Official shall not issue a building permit for installation of a
manufactured home within the town unless the manufactured home can be proven to
comply with those standards set forth in division (A) above. This prohibition shall also apply
to any manufactured home unit installation permit sought to be issued for the relocation of
any manufactured home unit within the Town.

(C) It shall be the responsibility of permit applicants to demonstrate to the Building
Official that any manufactured home for which an installation permit is requested is in
compliance with the standards set forth in division (A) above. Proof of compliance shall
include: a label certifying that the manufactured home unit has been inspected and
constructed in accordance with the requirements of the U.S. Department of Housing and
Urban Development (HUD) in effect at the date of manufacture wherein such date shall not
have been prior to June 15, 1976.

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
§ 150.45 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

(A) The International Fire Code, 2012 2606 Edition, published May 2011 Oetober

2006 by the International Code Council, Inc., is kereby adopted. with-the-feltowing
loealamendments:

(B) The following Local Amendments to the International Fire Code are adopted:

hall he Board of Appeals.”

2. Section 503.5.1 — This section is amended to read as follows: “When required,
oates and barricades shall be secured in an approved manner with a Knox box lock to
facilitate access by fire department personnel. Roads, trails, and other access ways that
have been closed or obstructed in the manner prescribed by Section 503.5 shall not be

r noru horiz h ner and the fir fficial.”
3. Section 503.6 (Security Gates) is amended and shall read “The installation of

security gates across a fire apparatus road shall be approved by the fire chief. Where
security eates are installed, they shall have an approved means of emergency operation.

Page 22 of 25



Th ri nd the emergen ration shall be maintain r’nl 11

imes. Electri installed in resi n11 lications shall ith an
r rride k i nd shall in r ith UL 2 LAl
lectri installed f ntr ’nri ntial iiin nd commercial si

hall i ith an “Opticom” rapid entr m, and shall comply with th.
requirements of ASTM F 2 i

4. Table 6104.3 footnote d is amended and shall read as follows: “At a consumer

si gg, the aggregate water capaci gg gi a multi- ggnggmgr mgggll_a_ggn, comprised of
individual LP- ntainers h r han 125 gallons, where th

| volu uals 1 lln [ MOr hmm1mm1 nce shall comply with th.

r LP- n mr.Ifmr han one such install inim h

llation shall I from other installation. 1 25 feet.”

5. ndix -C.D-Far ith the amendmen forth in su ion 6

. ion B105.1 of ndix B is amen nd shall r “All one an
famil llings having a fire fl Iculation area in ex f 800 re f hall
install an appr u ic fire sprinkler rh rov. T \

le of supplving 1 llons per minu fr ti f hour R
Exhibit A). Th lu11nr hll rmin in livable area under roof,

n famil Ih fi ﬂ Iculation ar ul t less than 480
uare fi ith an appr r supply, shal no fire sprinkler requirements.
Anv one or famil lling, regardl f size, which not have an appr
I | r ilable within fi f the str reonl r n, or after
Tune 1, 2013 (ORD 833, Exhibit A) must either install an approved water source or

rovide an matic fire sprinkler m. An ‘appr ly’ shall fin
municipal r ly (hydrant) within 600 fi f the structure as measur

fir ratus travel from the hydran h ratu ing area.” The 600 ft. rul
n ly to land legally cr rior ne 1,201 D Exhibit A).

Section D10Q3.2 of ndix D is amen n Ir “Fire A

hall not ex 1 rcent in grade.”
ion 2 an 2 — The foll inlnu i i
“\X/h r m is requir Knox x sh 11 11
1 in rmin he AHI] (authority having jurisdiction).”

Page 23 of 25



9. An Applicant may seek an exemption from a provision of the International Fire

hrough the installati f sprinklers if (i) sprinkl re n. herwise required;

(i) the use of sprinklers would mitigate any danger addressed by such Code provision;

in contr ion of Law. Th roval of any such r hall ithin th
iscretion of the Fire Chief.

Page 24 of 25



§ 150.99 PENALTY.

Any person;-firmrot-cotperation violating any-provistens-ef this Chapter or the codes adopted

under this Chapter shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portlon of
every day during which any violation ef-any is

commltted contmued or perm1tted Hpeﬁ—eeﬂ-vwﬁeﬂ—ef—aﬂ%sueh—ﬁe}a&eﬂ—wehpeﬁeﬂ—shaﬂ

111n hll nish ursuan 1n1099

Page 25 of 25



